RE: FOIA Request ($18,500 for police vest) - Sherry Jasinski
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RE: FOIA Request ($18,500 for police vest)

Finance Director Mohan Rao } = (o =) ())

Fri 1/6/2017 4:44 PM

To:Sherry Jasinski <sjasinski@saukvillage.org>;

CcFinance Director Mohan Rao <mrao@saukvillage.org>;

There’s no $18,500/- in 2013 grant for police vest.
Mohan Rao
Director, Finance

From: Sherry Jasinski
Sent: Friday, January 6, 2017 8:45 AM

To: Finance Director Mohan Rao <mrao@saukvillage.org>; Police Chief Robert ) Kowalski

<rjkowalski@saukvillage.org>
Cc: JW Fairman <jwfairman@saukvillage.org>; RMPaxson@aol.com
Subject: Fw: FOIA Request ($18,500 for police vest)

Please see the foia request below. It will be due on January 13.
Thank you,
Sherry

From: Bernice Brewer <bbrewer910@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 5, 2017 9:26 PM

To: Sherry Jasinski

Subject: FOIA Request (518,500 for police vest)

Attn: Ms Jasinski:

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | am seeking the following information:
The status of the 2013 grant in the amount of $18,500.00 for police vest.
Please provide supporting documents that show the status:

1. date(s) and amount received
2. disposition of funds

3. line item were funds post

4. how many vests were bought
5. date the vest were purchase
6. copy of invoice (s)

7. cost for each vest
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Your prompt attention to this matter is appreciated. Your response can be sent to
bbrewer910@gmail.com. If you have questions or concerns please call me at 773 983 7137.

Bernice Brewer
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